
July 11, 2006 
Present: Katheryne, Fergus, Yasmeen, Wynne, Talorgen, Brianna, Allegranza, Keena, Maeve, 
Susanna, Jonathan, Elizabeth. 
 
Meeting Called to Order: 7:18 
 
Officer Reports: 
Seneschal:  Maeve - Vivats to Lady Katherine and Lord Johan, who received their AoA’s at 
Wastelands.  Jonathan was inducted into the Order of Sacred Stone.  The request has been to 
move the meeting back to a non-food venue.   
 
Chronicler: Allegranza - Minutes and regnum are required for newsletter to be official and must 
be posted as a static webpage.  Will send reminder out for articles and submissions. 
 
MOAS :  Maeve - will post the Class list for Flight of the Falcon soon to the Merry Rose.  July 
19th at Jessamyn’s there will be a Chinese Fabric Exchange.  Allegranza will teach a Medieval 
Quilting class at the Aire Faucon A&S at Brianna’s.  Allegranza will post invite to the A&S 
night to the Baronial List. 
 
Chatelaine – Katheryne – Fax to Time Warner Cable for advertisement.  Will be adding no calls 
after 9p.m. to the ad.  Had two separate responses, invited them to the meeting.  Newcomer 
materials must be approved through the Kingdom Chatelaine.  Jonathan has created a brief 
pamphlet, that is awaiting a approval from kingdom. 
 
Knight’s Marshall – Not present, no change 
 
Exchequer – Susanna no change since last month. 
 
Web Minister – Not present.  Cyriac has some heraldic pictures associated with people, if you 
have those please send to Cyriac.   
 
Old Business: 
Flight of the Falcon II  -  Maeve -  We need to choose between the main hall and the small hall.  
It will be a Highness Progress, and possibly also a Royal Event.  Talorgen- What is the monetary 
difference between the two halls?  Jonathan – We risking a difference between the two is $200.  
The breakeven attendance for the main hall is 53 people.  The big hall is air conditioned.  
Motion- Susanna, Tal -Second, we use the big hall, no dissenting vote.    Application will be sent 
off this week needs check this week.   
Classes – we are requesting officer classes, especially chatelaine.  Katheryne volunteered to do a 
tea at Flight of the Falcon.   
 
New Business: 
 Meeting next month…where do we want it to be?  Jonathan recommends main library on 
Garrison.  Maeve – should we try it at the library for 3 months to see if attendance picks back up 
if it doesn’t we move it back?  Talorgen - if more people will attend then moving it is a good 
thing.  We pay can pay for the library out of the treasury.  Maeve will make the reservations.   
Talorgen moves that we adjourn. Allegranza seconds.  No opposing votes. 
 
 


